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QUESTION 1

You developed a custom model by using Vertex AI to predict your application\\'s user churn rate. You are using Vertex
AI Model Monitoring for skew detection. The training data stored in BigQuery contains two sets of features -
demographic and behavioral. You later discover that two separate models trained on each set perform better than the
original model. You need to configure a new model monitoring pipeline that splits traffic among the two models. You
want to use the same prediction-sampling-rate and monitoring-frequency for each model. You also want to minimize
management effort. What should you do? 

A. Keep the training dataset as is. Deploy the models to two separate endpoints, and submit two Vertex AI Model
Monitoring jobs with appropriately selected feature-thresholds parameters. 

B. Keep the training dataset as is. Deploy both models to the same endpoint and submit a Vertex AI Model Monitoring
job with a monitoring-config-from-file parameter that accounts for the model IDs and feature selections. 

C. Separate the training dataset into two tables based on demographic and behavioral features. Deploy the models to
two separate endpoints, and submit two Vertex AI Model Monitoring jobs. 

D. Separate the training dataset into two tables based on demographic and behavioral features. Deploy both models to
the same endpoint, and submit a Vertex AI Model Monitoring job with a monitoring-config-from-file parameter that
accounts for the model IDs and training datasets. 

Correct Answer: B 

 

 

QUESTION 2

You deployed an ML model into production a year ago. Every month, you collect all raw requests that were sent to your
model prediction service during the previous month. You send a subset of these requests to a human labeling service to
evaluate your model\\'s performance. After a year, you notice that your model\\'s performance sometimes degrades
significantly after a month, while other times it takes several months to notice any decrease in performance. The
labeling service is costly, but you also need to avoid large performance degradations. You want to determine how often
you should retrain your model to maintain a high level of performance while minimizing cost. What should you do? 

A. Train an anomaly detection model on the training dataset, and run all incoming requests through this model. If an
anomaly is detected, send the most recent serving data to the labeling service. 

B. Identify temporal patterns in your model\\'s performance over the previous year. Based on these patterns, create a
schedule for sending serving data to the labeling service for the next year. 

C. Compare the cost of the labeling service with the lost revenue due to model performance degradation over the past
year. If the lost revenue is greater than the cost of the labeling service, increase the frequency of model retraining;
otherwise, decrease the model retraining frequency. 

D. Run training-serving skew detection batch jobs every few days to compare the aggregate statistics of the features in
the training dataset with recent serving data. If skew is detected, send the most recent serving data to the labeling
service. 

Correct Answer: D 

https://cloud.google.com/blog/topics/developers-practitioners/monitor-models-training-serving-skew-vertex-aiew-vertex-
aiandved=2ahUKEwiRg_aoj9n8AhWb7TgGHcGCDREQFnoECAwQAQandusg=AOvVaw197NneIJM0ra7fLq2zsOin 
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QUESTION 3

You need to train a computer vision model that predicts the type of government ID present in a given image using a
GPU-powered virtual machine on Compute Engine. You use the following parameters: Optimizer: SGD Batch size = 64
Epochs = 10 Verbose =2 

During training you encounter the following error: ResourceExhaustedError: Out Of Memory (OOM) when allocating
tensor. What should you do? 

A. Change the optimizer. 

B. Reduce the batch size. 

C. Change the learning rate. 

D. Reduce the image shape. 

Correct Answer: B 

Reference: https://github.com/tensorflow/tensorflow/issues/136 

 

QUESTION 4

You work on a data science team at a bank and are creating an ML model to predict loan default risk. You have
collected and cleaned hundreds of millions of records worth of training data in a BigQuery table, and you now want to
develop and compare multiple models on this data using TensorFlow and Vertex AI. You want to minimize any
bottlenecks during the data ingestion state while considering scalability. What should you do? 

A. Use the BigQuery client library to load data into a dataframe, and use tf.data.Dataset.from_tensor_slices() to read it. 

B. Export data to CSV files in Cloud Storage, and use tf.data.TextLineDataset() to read them. 

C. Convert the data into TFRecords, and use tf.data.TFRecordDataset() to read them. 

D. Use TensorFlow I/O\\'s BigQuery Reader to directly read the data. 

Correct Answer: D 

https://www.tensorflow.org/io/api_docs/python/tfio/bigquery 

 

QUESTION 5

You work for a pharmaceutical company based in Canada. Your team developed a BigQuery ML model to predict the
number of flu infections for the next month in Canada. Weather data is published weekly, and flu infection statistics are
published monthly. You need to configure a model retraining policy that minimizes cost. What should you do? 

A. Download the weather and flu data each week. Configure Cloud Scheduler to execute a Vertex AI pipeline to retrain
the model weekly. 

B. Download the weather and flu data each month. Configure Cloud Scheduler to execute a Vertex AI pipeline to retrain
the model monthly. 
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C. Download the weather and flu data each week. Configure Cloud Scheduler to execute a Vertex AI pipeline to retrain
the model every month. 

D. Download the weather data each week, and download the flu data each month. Deploy the model to a Vertex AI
endpoint with feature drift monitoring, and retrain the model if a monitoring alert is detected. 

Correct Answer: D 
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