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QUESTION 1

What are two network requirements for a four-node FSVM deployment? (Choose two.) 

A. Four available IP addresses on the Storage network 

B. Five available IP addresses on the Client network 

C. Five available IP addresses on the Storage network 

D. Four available IP addresses on the Client network 

Correct Answer: BC 

Explanation: The two network requirements for a four-node FSVM deployment are five available IP addresses on the
Client network and five available IP addresses on the Storage network. The Client network is used for communication
between the FSVMs and the clients, while the Storage network is used for communication between the FSVMs and the
CVMs. For each FSVM, one Client IP and one Storage IP are required. Additionally, one extra Client IP is required for
the file server VIP (Virtual IP), which is used as a single point of access for all shares and exports on the file server.
References: Nutanix Files Administration Guide, page 28; Nutanix Files Solution Guide, page 7 

 

QUESTION 2

What tool can be used to report on a specific user\\'s activity within a Files environment? 

A. Prism Element Alerts menu 

B. Prism Central Activity menu 

C. Data Lens Audit Trails 

D. Files Console Usage 

Correct Answer: C 

Explanation: The tool that can be used to report on a specific user\\'s activity within a Files environment is Data Lens
Audit Trails. Data Lens Audit Trails is a feature that provides detailed logs of all file operations performed by users on
Files shares and exports, such as create, read, write, delete, rename, move, copy, etc. Data Lens Audit Trails can help
administrators track and audit user actions and identify any unauthorized or malicious activities. The administrator can
use Data Lens Audit Trails to filter and search for a specific user\\'s activity based on various criteria, such as file name,
file type, file size, file path, file share, file server, operation type, operation time, operation status, and so on.
References: Nutanix Files Administration Guide, page 98; Nutanix Data Lens User Guide 

 

QUESTION 3

An organization currently has a Files cluster for their office data including all department shares. Most of the data is
considered cold Data and they are looking to migrate to free up space for future growth or newer data. 

The organization has recently added an additional node with more storage. In addition, the organization is using the
Public Cloud for .. storage needs. 
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What will be the best way to achieve this requirement? 

A. Migrate cold data from the Files to tape storage. 

B. Backup the data using a third-party software and replicate to the cloud. 

C. Setup another cluster and replicate the data with Protection Domain. 

D. Enable Smart Tiering in Files within the File Console. 

Correct Answer: D 

 

QUESTION 4

An administrator has discovered that File server services are down on a cluster. 

Which service should the administrator investigation for this issue? 

A. Minerva-nvm 

B. Sys_stats_server 

C. Cassandra 

D. Insights_collector 

Correct Answer: A 

Explanation: The service that the administrator should investigate for this issue is Minerva-nvm. Minerva-nvm is a
service that runs on each CVM and provides communication between Prism Central and Files services. Minerva-nvm
also monitors the health of Files services and reports any failures or alerts to Prism Central. If Minerva-nvm is down on
any CVM, it can affect the availability and functionality of Files services on that cluster. References: Nutanix Files
Administration Guide, page 23; Nutanix Files Troubleshooting Guide 

 

QUESTION 5

Users are complaining about having to reconnecting to share when there are networking issues. 

Which files feature should the administrator enable to ensure the sessions will auto- reconnect in such events? 

A. Durable File Handles 

B. Multi-Protocol Shares 

C. Connected Shares 

D. Workload Optimization 

Correct Answer: A 

Explanation: The Files feature that the administrator should enable to ensure the sessions will auto-reconnect in such
events is Durable File Handles. Durable File Handles is a feature that allows SMB clients to reconnect to a file server
after a temporary network disruption or a client sleep state without losing the handle to the open file. Durable File
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Handles can improve the user experience and reduce the risk of data loss or corruption. Durable File Handles can be
enabled for each share in the Files Console. References: Nutanix Files Administration Guide, page 76; Nutanix Files
Solution Guide, page 10 
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