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QUESTION 1

Three weeks following discharge, a male client is readmitted to the psychiatric unit for depression. His wife stated that
he had threatened to kill himself with a handgun. As the nurse admits him to the unit, he says, "I wish I were dead
because I am worthless to everyone; I guess I am just no good." Which response by the nurse is most appropriate at
this time? 

A. "I don\\'t think you are worthless. I\\'m glad to see you, and we will help you." 

B. "Don\\'t you think this is a sign of your illness?" 

C. "I know with your wife and new baby that you do have a lot to live for." 

D. "You\\'ve been feeling sad and alone for some time now?" 

Correct Answer: D 

(A) This response does not acknowledge the client\\'s feelings. (B) This is a closed question and does not encourage
communication. (C) This response negates the client\\'s feelings and does not require a response from the client. (D)
This acknowledges the client\\'s implied thoughts and feelings and encourages a response. 

 

QUESTION 2

In the client with a diagnosis of coronary artery disease, the nurse would anticipate the complication of bradycardia with
occlusion of which coronary artery? 

A. Right coronary artery 

B. Left main coronary artery 

C. Circumflex coronary artery 

D. Left anterior descending coronary artery 

Correct Answer: A 

(A) Sinus bradycardia and atrioventricular (AV) heart block are usually a result of right coronary artery occlusion. The
right coronary artery perfuses the sinoatrial and AV nodes in mostindividuals. (B) Occlusion of the left main coronary
artery causes bundle branch blocks and premature ventricular contractions. (C) Occlusion of the circumflex artery does
not cause bradycardia. (D) Sinus tachycardia occurs primarily with left anterior descending coronary artery occlusion
because this form of occlusion impairs left ventricular function. 

 

QUESTION 3

A client had a hemicolectomy performed 2 days ago. Today, when the nurse assesses the incision, a small part of the
abdominal viscera is seen protruding through the incision. This complication of wound healing is known as: 

A. Excoriation 

B. Dehiscence 
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C. Decortication 

D. Evisceration 

Correct Answer: D 

(A) Excoriation is abrasion of the epidermis or of the coating of any organ of the body by trauma, chemicals, burns, or
other causes. (B) Dehiscence is a partial or complete separation of the wound edges with no protrusion of abdominal
tissue. (C) Decortication is removal of the surface layer of an organ or structure. It is a type of surgery, such as
removing the fibrinous peel from the visceral pleura in thoracic surgery. (D) Evisceration occurs when the incision
separates and the contents of the cavity spill out. 

 

QUESTION 4

A 35-year-old client has returned to her room following surgery on her right femur. She has an IV of D5 in onehalf
normal saline infusing at 125 mL/hr and is receiving morphine sulfate 10?5 mg IM q4h prn for pain. She last voided 51/2
hours ago when she was given her preoperative medication. In monitoring and promoting return of urinary function after
surgery, the nurse would: 

A. Provide food and fluids at the client\\'s request 

B. Maintain IV, increasing the rate hourly until the client voids 

C. Report to the surgeon if the client is unable to void within 8 hours of surgery 

D. Hold morphine sulfate injections for pain until the client voids, explaining to her that morphine sulfate can cause
urinary retention 

Correct Answer: C 

(A) Provision of food and fluid promotes bowel elimination. Nutritional needs postoperatively are determined by the
physician, not the client. (B) Increasing IV fluids postoperatively will not cause a client to void. Any change in rate of
administration of IV fluids should be determined by the physician. (C) The postoperative client with normal kidney
function who cannot void 8 hours after surgery is retaining urine. The client may need catheterization or medication. The
physician must provide orders for both as necessary. (D) Although morphine sulfate can cause urinary retention,
withholding pain medication will not ensure that the client will void. The client with uncontrolled pain will probably not be
able to void. 

 

QUESTION 5

A female client is admitted to the emergency department complaining of severe right-sided abdominal pain and vaginal
spotting. She states that her last menstrual period was about 2 months ago. A positive pregnancy test result and
ultrasonography confirm an ectopic pregnancy. The nurse could best explain to the client that her condition is caused
by: 

A. Abnormal development of the embryo 

B. A distended or ruptured fallopian tube 

C. A congenital abnormality of the tube 

D. A malfunctioning of the placenta 
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Correct Answer: B 

(A) The embryo itself may develop normally in the first several weeks of an ectopic pregnancy. (B) An ectopic
pregnancy in the fallopian tube causes severe pain owing to the size of the growing embryo within the narrow lumen of
the tube, causing distention and finally rupture within the first 12 weeks of pregnancy. (C) The Fallopian tube may either
be normal or contain adhesions caused by a history of pelvic inflammatory disease or tubal surgeries, neither of which
are congenital causes. (D) An ectopic pregnancy does not involve a dysfunctional placenta, but the implantation of the
blastocyst outside the uterus. 
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