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QUESTION 1

You need to recommend a solution to deploy App1. The solution must meet the application requirements. What should
you include in the recommendation? 

A. Create an .rdp file for App1, and then copy the file to the client computers by using a logon script. 

B. Configure the software installation settings in a Group Policy object (GPO). 

C. Configure the RemoteApp and Desktop Connections setting in a Group Policy object (GPO). 

D. Create an .rdp file for App1, and then copy the file to the client computers by using a startup script. 

Correct Answer: C 

Using a GPO to set the RA and RD Connections allows you to input a URL that publishes the applications and then
allows them to use document invocation. 

 

QUESTION 2

Your network contains two Remote Desktop Services (RDS) session collections named Collection 1 and Collection2. 

Each user has a laptop computer that runs Windows 8. 

The users frequently log on to sessions in Collection1 and Collection2. 

You need to recommend a user state virtualization solution to meet the following requirements: 

Ensure that the user profiles remain the same when the users log on to their laptop computer and virtual desktop. 

Minimize the time required to log on. What should you implement? 

A. 

Folder Redirection and user profile disks 

B. 

User profiles for Remote Desktop Services (RDS) and roaming profiles 

C. 

User profiles for Remote Desktop Services (RDS) and Folder Redirection 

D. 

Roaming profiles and Folder Redirection 

Correct Answer: D 

Roaming User Profiles redirects user profiles to a file share so that users receive the same operating system and
application settings on multiple computers. When a user signs in to a computer by using an account that is set up with a
file share as the profile path, the user\\'s profile is downloaded to the local computer and merged with the local profile (if
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present). When the user signs out of the computer, the local copy of their profile, including any changes, is merged with
the server copy of the profile. Roaming User Profiles is typically enabled on domain accounts by a network
administrator. Folder Redirection enables users and administrators to redirect the path of a known folder to a new
location, manually or by using Group Policy. The new location can be a folder on the local computer or a directory on a
file share. Users interact with files in the redirected folder as if it still existed on the local drive. For example, you can
redirect the Documents folder, which is usually stored on a local drive, to a network location. The files in the folder are
then available to the user from any computer on the network. 

 

QUESTION 3

Your network contains an Active Directory domain named contoso.com. The domain contains a server named Server1
that has Microsoft System Center 2012 Configuration Manager installed. All client computers run Windows 7. 

You plan to deploy Windows 8 to all of the client computers. 
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You discover that the Client Replace Task Sequence task sequence is unavailable from the Configuration Manager
console. 

You need to ensure that the Client Replace Task Sequence task sequence is available from Configuration Manager. 

What should you install on Server1? 

A. The Windows Automated Installation Kit (Windows AIK) 

B. The System Center 2012 Configuration Manager Toolkit 

C. The Windows Assessment and Deployment Kit (Windows ADK) 

D. Microsoft Deployment Toolkit (MDT) 2012 

Correct Answer: D 

The Client Replace Task Sequence will only be available if we integrate MDT in SCCM: 

 

QUESTION 4

Your network contains a Remote Desktop Services (RDS) session collection named Collection1. 

You need to configure which users can connect to the Remote Desktop Session Host (RD Session Host) servers in
Collection1. 
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What should you configure from the properties of Collection1? 

A. Security 

B. Connections 

C. User Groups 

D. Client Settings 

Correct Answer: C 

Remote Desktop Services accelerates and extends desktop and application deployments to any device, improving
remote worker efficiency, while helping to keep critical intellectual property secure and simplify regulatory compliance.
Remote 

Desktop Services enables virtual desktop infrastructure (VDI), session-based desktops, and applications, allowing users
to work anywhere. 

Remote Desktop Services (RDS) - Session Collection There are basically two types of RDS collections, Virtual Machine
and Session. 

-A Virtual Desktop collection deals with managing pools of VM desktops that can be made available to users (or they
can also be dedicated to specific users). -A Session collection is the old Terminal Services model. In Windows Server
2008 

R2, the RemoteApp feature was introduced which allowed for seamless published applications. RemoteApp is also part
of RDS in 2012 (but much easier to manage). 

 

QUESTION 5

You have a corporate image of Windows 8 named Imagel.wim. 

You deploy Image1 from a bootable USB flash drive to a client computer named Computer1. You add several
applications to Image1 and configure the applications. 

You need to capture the modified image to the bootable USB flash drive as Image2. The solution must meet the
following requirements: 

The amount of disk space required for storage must be minimized. 

The settings of Image1 must be retained. 

You start the client computer from a Windows Pre-installation Environment (Windows PE) deployment image. 

What should you do next? (Each correct answer presents a complete solution. Choose all that apply.) 

A. 

Run the imagex.exe command and specify the /capture parameter. 

B. 

Run the imagex.exe command and specify the /append parameter. 
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C. 

Run the dism.exe command and specify the /capture-image parameter. 

D. 

Run the dism.exe command and specify the /append-image parameter. 

E. 

Run the diskpart attach command. 

F. 

Run the diskpart select command. 

Correct Answer: CF 

Run the dism.exe command and specify the /capture-image parameter http://msdn.microsoft.com/en-
us/library/jj980032(v=winembedded.81).aspx 

Run the imagex.exe command and specify the /append parameter. http://technet.microsoft.com/en-
us/library/cc749447(v=ws.10).aspx 
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You can append a volume to an existing image. DISM and ImageX can both be used for this function. 
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