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QUESTION 1

NEW FOLDER UPLOAD FILES UPLOAD FOLDERS REGISTERED VM DOWNLOAD DATE COPY to MOVE TO
RENAME TO DELETE 

Name Size Modified Type Path 

dvsData 05/03/2022, 9.10.21 AM Folder [vsandatastore] 

.sdd.sf 05/03/2022, 9.10.21 AM Folder [vsandatastore] 

app02-000002.vmdk 05/03/2022, 9.10.21 AM Folder [vsandatastore] 

app02-000003.vmdk 05/03/2022, 9.10.21 AM Folder [vsandatastore] 

app02-000002.hlog 05/03/2022, 9.10.21 AM Folder [vsandatastore] 

app02-000002.vswap 05/03/2022, 9.10.21 AM Folder [vsandatastore] 

app02-000002.vswap.lck 05/03/2022, 9.10.21 AM Folder [vsandatastore] 

A cloud administrator is asked to troubleshoot a virtual machine (app02) that is performing slowly. The cloud
Administrator noticed that app02 is con expected amount of disk space. As a first step, the cloud administrator uses
VMware vCenter to check the snapshot manager for app02 and no snapshot -- cloud administrator then navigates to the
app02 files on the datastore, and is presented with the information provided in the exhibits. 

Given the information provided, which task should the cloud administrator perform to resolve this issue? 

A. Migrate the virtual machine to a new datastore. 

B. Perform a snapshot consolidation. 

C. Power cycle the virtual machine. 

D. Execute a Delete All Snapshots task. 

Correct Answer: D 

 

 

QUESTION 2

A cloud administrator with an existing virtual private cloud (VPC) needs to create a dedicated connection to VMware
Cloud on AWS. Which connection type would meet this requirement? 

A. Public virtual interface 

B. AWS Direct Connect 

C. Transit virtual interface 

D. Private virtual interface 
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Correct Answer: B 

The best option to meet the requirements of creating a dedicated connection to VMware Cloud on AWS is to use AWS
Direct Connect. AWS Direct Connect provides a dedicated network connection between an on-premises data center
and the Amazon Web Services (AWS) cloud, allowing for the transfer of data across the two locations. It is more reliable
and has lower latency than other options such as public virtual interface, transit virtual interface, and private virtual
interface. Additionally, AWS Direct Connect provides the highest performance and throughput of any of the on-premises
data center connectivity options. 

Why does VMware refuse to educate their customers ... - VMware ... https://communities.vmware.com/t5/VMware-
Education-Services/Why-does-VMware-refuse-to-educate-their-customers/td-p/2005973 

VMware Technical Support Guide https://www.vmware.com/pdf/techsupportguide.pdf 

Publishing Applications with VMware Horizon 7 https://vcdx.vmware.com/content/dam/digitalmarketing/vmware/ru/pdf/te
chpaper/vmware-horizon-7-application-publishing.pdf 

 

QUESTION 3

Refer to the exhibit. 

A cloud administrator is deploying a new VMware Cloud on AWS virtual private cloud (VPC). After clicking on deploy,
the screen refreshes and displays the information that is provided in the exhibit. What is the issue with the management
CIDR that is causing the deployment to fall? 

A. It overlaps with the AWS subnet. 

B. It overlaps with the AWS VPC CIDR. 

C. It is part of the reserved CIDRs. 

D. It is an invalid size. 

Correct Answer: A 

Latest 2V0-33.22 Dumps | 2V0-33.22 VCE Dumps | 2V0-33.22 Study Guide                                3 / 5

https://www.pass4itsure.com/2v0-33-22.html
https://www.pass4itsure.com/2v0-33-22.html
https://www.pass4itsure.com/2v0-33-22.html


https://www.pass4itsure.com/2v0-33-22.html
2024 Latest pass4itsure 2V0-33.22 PDF and VCE dumps Download

 

https://docs.aws.amazon.com/whitepapers/latest/sddc-deployment-and-best- practices/deploying-vmware-cloud-on-aws-
sddc.htmlThis must be a RFC1918 private address space (10.0.0.0/8, 172.16.0.0/12, or 192.168.0.0/16) with CIDR
block sizes of /16, /20, or /23. The management CIDR block cannot be changed after the SDDC is deployed. Choose a
range of IP addresses that does not overlap with the AWS subnet you are connecting to. If you plan to connect the
SDDC to an on-premises DC or another environment, the IP subnet must be unique within your enterprise network
infrastructure. Choose a CIDR that will give you future scalability. 

 

QUESTION 4

A cloud administrator is planning to migrate 1,000 VMs from their existing on-premises location into VMware Cloud on
AWS. The migration will need to be completed as quickly as possible. Upon completion, the users will need the most
reliable, lowest latency connection possible. 

Which on-premises data center connectivity option will meet these requirements? 

A. Layer 2 VPN 

B. AWS Direct Connect 

C. VMware Transit Connect 

D. IPsec VPN 

Correct Answer: B 

The best option to meet the requirements of quickly migrating 1,000 VMs with the lowest latency and most reliable
connection possible is to use AWS Direct Connect. AWS Direct Connect provides a dedicated network connection
between an on- premises data center and the Amazon Web Services (AWS) cloud, allowing for the transfer of data
across the two locations. It is more reliable and has lower latency than other options such as Layer 2 VPN, VMware
Transit Connect, and IPsec VPN. Additionally, AWS Direct Connect provides the highest performance and throughput of
any of the on-premises data center connectivity options. Why does VMware refuse to educate their customers ... -
VMware ... https://communities.vmware.com/t5/VMware-Education-Services/Why-does-VMware-refuse-to-educate-their-
customers/td-p/2005973 

VMware Technical Support Guide https://www.vmware.com/pdf/techsupportguide.pdf 

Publishing Applications with VMware Horizon 7 https://vcdx.vmware.com/content/dam/digitalmarketing/vmware/ru/pdf/te
chpaper/vmware-horizon-7-application-publishing.pdf 

 

QUESTION 5

What are two Incident management services included in the VMware Cloud on AWS service management process?
(Choose two.) 

A. Email notifications for pending upgrades 

B. Return to service 

C. Severity classification 

D. SDDC upgrades 
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E. Workload incident management 

Correct Answer: BC 

Incident and Problem Management: VMware will provide incident and problem management services (e.g., detection,
severity classification, recording, escalation, and return to service) pertaining to availability of the Service Offering.
VMware is responsible for incident and problem management (e.g., detection, severity classification, recording,
escalation, and return to service) pertaining to all virtual machines that you have deployed in your SDDC.
https://www.vmware.com/content/dam/digitalmarketing/vmware/en/pdf/support/vmw-cloud-aws-service-description.pdf 
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