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QUESTION 1

You have recently been asked to take over management of your company\\'s infrastructure provisioning efforts, utilizing
Terraform v0.12 to provision and manage infrastructure resources in Oracle Cloud Infrastructure (OCI). For the past few
days the development environments have been failing to provision. Terraform returns the following error: You locate the
related code block in the Terraform config and find the following: 

Which correction should you make to solve this issue? (Choose the best answer.) 

A. Place a command at the end of line 16 

B. Modify line 15 to be the following: tcp_options = {min = “22”, max = “22”) 

C. Modify line 15 to be the following: tcp_options { min = “22” max = “22” } 

D. Replace the curly braces ‘{ }’ in lines 11 and 16 with square braces ‘[ ]’ 

Correct Answer: B 

 

 

QUESTION 2

Multiple teams are sharing a tenancy in Oracle Cloud Infrastructure (OCI). You are asked to figure out an appropriate
method to manage OCI costs. 

Which is NOT a valid technique to accurately attribute costs to resources used by each team? (Choose the best
answer.) 

A. Create a Cost-Tracking tag. Apply this tag to all resources with team information. Use the OCI cost analysis tools to
filter costs by tags. 

B. Create separate compartment for each team. Use the OCI cost analysis tools to filter costs by compartment. 

C. Create an Identity and Access Management (IAM) group for each team. Create an OCI budget for each group to
track spending. 
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D. Define and use tags for resources used by each team. Analyze usage data from the OCI Usage Report which has
detailed information about resources and tags. 

Correct Answer: C 

 

 

QUESTION 3

An insurance company has contracted you to help automate their application business continuity plan. They have the
application running in eu-frankfurt-1 as the primary site and uk-london-1 as a disaster recovery site. Normally they have
a DNS A record associated with the IP address of the primary endpoint in eu-frankfurt-1. In the event of a disaster, they
use OCI DNS Zone Management to update the A record and replace it with the IP address of the endpoint in uk-
londond-1. 

How can you automate the failover process? (Choose the best answer.) 

A. Create a Health Check that evaluates both regional endpoints. Create a Traffic Management Steering policy with
Failover type and associate it with the Health Check. 

B. Create a Traffic Management Steering policy with Load Balancer type and add both eu-frankfurt-1 and uk-london-1
endpoints. Attach the Traffic Management Steering policy to the A record. 

C. Provision a Load Balancer in Frankfurt and associate it with the A record in DNS. Create a backend set with backend
servers from both eu-frankfurt-1 and uk-london-1 regions. 

D. Create a Traffic Management Steering policy and attach it to a backend servers from both eu-frankfurt1 and uk-
london-1 regions. 

Correct Answer: B 

 

 

QUESTION 4

Your application is using an Object Storage bucket named app-data in the namespace vision, to store both persistent
and temporary data. Every week all the temporary data should be deleted to limit the storage consumption. 

Currently you need to navigate to the Object Storage page using the web console, select the appropriate bucket to view
all the objects and delete the temporary ones. 

To simplify the task you have configured the application to save all the temporary data with /temp prefix. You have also
decided to use the Command Line Interface (CLI) to perform this operation. 

What is the command you should use to speed up the data cleanup? (Choose the best answer.) 

A. oci os object delete –ns vision –bn app–data ––prefix /temp 

B. oci os object bulk-delete –ns vision –bn app–data ––prefix /temp ––force 

C. oci objectstorage bulk–delete –ns vision –bn app–data ––prefix /temp ––force 

D. oci os object delete app-data in vision where prefix = /temp 
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Correct Answer: B 

 

 

QUESTION 5

You have created a geolocation steering policy in the Oracle Cloud Infrastructure (OCI) Traffic Management service,
with this configuration: 

What happens to requests that originate in Africa? (Choose the best answer.) 

A. The traffic will be forwarded at the same time to both Pool 1 and Pool 2. 

B. The traffic will be dropped. 

C. The traffic will be forwarded randomly to any of the pools mentioned in the rules. 

D. The traffic will be forwarded to Pool 1. If Pool 1 is not available, then it will be forwarded to Pool 2. 

Correct Answer: D 

 

1Z0-1067-21 PDF Dumps 1Z0-1067-21 Practice Test 1Z0-1067-21 Exam
Questions

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

1Z0-1067-21 PDF Dumps | 1Z0-1067-21 Practice Test | 1Z0-1067-21 Exam Questions                               4 / 4

https://www.pass4itsure.com/1z0-1067-21.html
https://www.pass4itsure.com/1z0-1067-21.html
https://www.pass4itsure.com/1z0-1067-21.html
https://www.pass4itsure.com/1z0-1067-21.html
http://www.tcpdf.org
https://www.pass4itsure.com/1z0-1067-21.html
https://www.pass4itsure.com/1z0-1067-21.html
https://www.pass4itsure.com/1z0-1067-21.html

